
Opinion
News

Joe Biden speaks with attendees at the Clark County Democratic Party's 2020 Kick
Off to Caucus Gala at the Tropicana Las Vegas in Las Vegas, Nevada, Feb. 15.
(Wikimedia Commons/Gage Skidmore)

by Michael Sean Winters

View Author Profile

Follow on Twitter at @michaelswinters

Join the Conversation

http://staging.globalsistersreport.org/sections/opinion
http://staging.globalsistersreport.org/sections/news
http://staging.globalsistersreport.org/authors/michael-sean-winters
https://www.twitter.com/michaelswinters
http://staging.globalsistersreport.org/join-conversation


March 23, 2020
Share on BlueskyShare on FacebookShare on TwitterEmail to a friendPrint

On Friday, I looked at some of the potential political consequences flowing from the
COVID-19 crisis and, more importantly, from the failed response to that virus by
President Donald Trump and his administration. I finished on a dark note and was
thinking about how the current crisis is ripe for exploitation by an authoritarian
Trump, but Michael Gerson at The Washington Post beat me to that punch. So,
instead, let's turn our gaze to the Democrats and how they should navigate this
radically altered political landscape.

We know now that the nominee of the party will be former Vice President Joe Biden.
And we know something else: His essential human decency and almost tactile
empathy, on full display in his victory speech after last Tuesday night's primary
wins, are an exact counterpoint to Trump's narcissistic bombast. Suddenly, Biden's
long experience in Washington, knowing how to exercise the levers of power, are an
asset, not a liability, as the country is forced to recognize the price we have paid —
and are paying — for conferring the vast powers of the presidency on a man who
has nothing but contempt for career government officials and whose incompetent
response to the coronavirus is costing lives.

Decency, competence and empathy are important qualities in a president, but they
are not exhaustive. A successful president must be a successful politician and that
requires an ability to articulate a vision of governance that appeals to a majority of
the electorate. Trump, catching the populist wave that began in response to the
bailouts of 2008-2009, rode it to victory in 2016. He understood better than any
Republican before him that he could shift from dog whistles about race and gender
to German shepherd whistles without paying a price but, instead, bringing longtime
conservative Democrats into his camp. Thomas B. Edsall at The New York Times
recently examined the coalition that supported Sen. Bernie Sanders in 2016, and
why some of his supporters ended up voting for Trump. Rarely has an op-ed piece
seemed at once so excruciatingly accurate and so deeply depressing.

It is up to Biden — and to all Democrats running for office this fall — to remind
voters that the party has always believed government can be a force for good in
people's lives, a belief that is not utterly self-evident. (I note in passing that Catholic
social teaching has always seen government as a good thing per se, and it tells you
much of what you need to know about conservative Catholic Republicans that they
have become so sympathetic to libertarian ideas.) The old Reaganite trope about

https://bsky.app/intent/compose?text=Time+is+now+for+Democrats%2C+Joe+Biden+to+shape+this+narrative+http%3A%2F%2Fstaging.globalsistersreport.org%2Fprint%2Fpdf%2Fnode%2F188542
https://www.facebook.com/sharer/sharer.php?u=http%3A%2F%2Fstaging.globalsistersreport.org%2Fprint%2Fpdf%2Fnode%2F188542
https://twitter.com/intent/tweet?url=http://staging.globalsistersreport.org/print/pdf/node/188542&via=sistersreport&text=Time is now for Democrats, Joe Biden to shape this narrative
mailto:?subject=Global%20Sisters%20Report%3A%20Time%20is%20now%20for%20Democrats%2C%20Joe%20Biden%20to%20shape%20this%20narrative&body=By%20Michael%20Sean%20Winters%0AMarch%2023%2C%202020%0A%0ADistinctly%20Catholic%3A%20It%20is%20up%20to%20Biden%20%E2%80%94%20and%20to%20all%20Democrats%20running%20for%20office%20this%20fall%20%E2%80%94%20to%20remind%20voters%20that%20the%20party%20has%20always%20believed%20government%20can%20be%20a%20force%20for%20good%20in%20people%27s%20lives%2C%20a%20belief%20that%20is%20not%20utterly%20self-evident.%0A%0ARead%20more%3A%20http%3A%2F%2Fstaging.globalsistersreport.org%2Fprint%2Fpdf%2Fnode%2F188542
http://staging.globalsistersreport.org/print/pdf/node/188542
https://www.ncronline.org/node/188502
https://www.washingtonpost.com/opinions/coronavirus-might-make-authoritarianism-look-like-the-answer-its-not/2020/03/19/ebfc72c0-6a06-11ea-abef-020f086a3fab_story.html
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ukhCbJHpQZg
https://www.nytimes.com/2020/03/11/opinion/sanders-trump-biden.html


government being the problem, not the solution, rings hollow today when only the
government stands between the populace and devastation.

Advertisement

Biden must go further than simply affirming a long-held belief, however. He must
recognize, as Trump already has, that in times of crisis and fear, people want a
scapegoat, someone to blame. Trump has already made it clear that China will be
his boogeyman, and there is some justice, as well as a whole lot of hypocrisy, in his
laying blame at the feet of the Chinese government. The response from the
Democrats has been to accuse Trump of racism, but that accusation is irrelevant: It
is like throwing mud at someone who is already covered in mud. It will merely blend
in. No, as I discussed Friday, the Democrats need to keep an intense spotlight on the
Trump administration's mishandling of this crisis for two long months. And, as a
bonus, it won't hurt to demand, with great justice, the resignations of Senators 
Richard Burr and Kelly Loeffler both of whom reportedly sold off their stocks after a
private briefing about the coronavirus in February, but did not bother to warn the
rest of us. If any Democrat is found to have done the same, their resignation should
also be demanded.

A trader in New York City wears a face mask on the floor of the New York Stock
Exchange March 19. (CNS/Reuters/Lucas Jackson)
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Biden should also remember that the Obama administration's failure to bail out
people whose houses were being foreclosed as fulsomely as they bailed out the big
banks on Wall Street was, along with the persistent racism and sexism of the
culture, the proximate cause of Trump's political success, the gunpowder of populist
rage that he ignited in 2016. Just as he did as a candidate, Trump sounds at times
like he is running to the left of the Democrats. Biden can't let him get away with
that. He should back Sen. Elizabeth Warren's call for certain requirements from any
corporation that receives bailout dollars, most especially the banning of bonuses for
executives receiving government relief — and for three years after that — and
banning stock buybacks for good. If taxpayer money is going to be used to bail out
large corporations, many of which do not pay any taxes, the government has every
right to make such demands. Fool me once …

At the level of personnel, it might be a good idea if Biden brought back Jared
Bernstein as one of his principal economic advisers. Bernstein is a senior fellow at
the Center on Budget and Policy Priorities, arguably the finest progressive think tank
in Washington, and he was Biden's principal economic adviser from 2009 to 2011.
Had the administration then listened to Bernstein rather than to Team Wall Street,
our nation might be in a much better political place than it is today. I am told
Bernstein and Biden parted on good terms. Time to bring him back.

We all hope the virus is tamed and tamed soon. But the economic fallout could be
with us for a long time. It is vital that the Democrats shape the terms of the election
now and in the next couple of weeks. If Trump can shape the narrative — and his
approval rating continues to tick up — it will be too late. In the best interests of the
nation we love, and with as much decency as he can, Biden needs to go for Trump's
political jugular now.

[Michael Sean Winters covers the nexus of religion and politics for NCR.]

Editor's note: Don't miss out on Michael Sean Winters' latest. Sign up and we'll let
you know when he publishes new Distinctly Catholic columns.
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